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Kuldeep Sandhu <kuldeepsinghsandhu.sandhu@gmail.com>

B Gmail

Fw: Congratulations, for research proposal grant k ; .
: : : Wed, Dec 7, 2022 at 3:05 PM

Dr. Rajiv Kumar <rajiv_parashar1 7@yahoo.co.in>
Reply-To: "Dr. Rajiv Kumar" <rajiv_parashar17@yahoo.co.in>
To: "kuldeepsinghsandhu,sandhu@gmail.com" <kuldeepsinghsandhu.sandhu@gmail.com>

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

--— Forwarded message -——
From: "Dean Alumni Relations PU" <darpu@pu.ac.in>

To: "Rajiv_parashar17@yahoo.co.in" <Rajiv_parashar17@yahoo.co.in>
Cc:

Sent: Tue, 21 Jul 2020 at 12:25

Subject: Congratulations, for research proposal grant

Dear Dr. Rajiv Kumar,
“Natural Gum based Gel Biopolymer Electrolytes for sustainable Energy Sources” in response to our advertisement

This refers to your application regarding Research Proposal entitled
dated 20.08.2019 for the award of Research Grant.

posal has been selected for award of research grant of Rs. 1,55,000/- from the Research Promotion Fund created out of the Ranjab University Alumni
¢

/

selected candidate from the

This is inform you that your pro
Association Fund.
You are requested to kindly accept this offer of grant within two weeks from the date of issue of this letter failing which the grant will be awarded to the next
waiting list.
I
\

The monitoring & evaluation procedure for the release of grant is as follows:
. \

1. The first installment of 60% of the total grant will be released to the successful applicants at the time of award.
2. A midterm report shall be prepared by the P.I. for presentation to the monitoring evaluation committee and after proper evaluation; if found suitable, remaining 40% grant will be

released.
g with consolidated item wise statement, bills and audit report of expenditure as per budget specifications by the

3. Itis mandatory to submit the report and research outcomes alon
Principal Investigator (P.1.) after completion of study. '
ed immediately through RTGS/DD/Cheque/Cash to Dean Alumni Relations

4. The unutilized grant (if any) may be return
House Fund, A/c no: 10444985192, Branch: SBI, Sector-14, PU Campus and IFSC Code: SBIN0000742.

» Panjab University, Chandigarh in the name of PUAA and Alumni

Note: As the number of good proposals shortlisted are enough and also due to the Covid-19 pandemic this year it was not possible to initiate the Same process to award research grants for
research promotion for the financial year 2019-20, so it is decided to merge the funds available with PUAA for the financial year 2018-20 and award the Research Grants to the above

applicants.
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Kuldeep Sandhu <kuldeepsinghsandhu.sandhu@gmail.com>

Fw: Release of second instalment for ;'ésea'r{:vl{;roposal

2 messages

Wed, Dec 7, 2022 at 2:52 PM

Dr. Rajiv Kumar <rajiv_parashar17@yahoo.co.in>
Rep"ly-To: "DrA_ Rajiv Kumar" <rajiv_parashar17@yahoo.co.in>
To: "kuldeepsinghsandhu.sandhu@gmail.com" <kuldeepsinghsandhu.sandhu@gmail.com>

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

—-— Forwarded message -——
From: "Dean Alumni Relations PU" <darpu@pu.ac.in>
To: "rajiv_parashar17@yahoo.co.in" <rajiv_parashar17@yahoo.co.in>

Cc:
Sent: Thu, 10 Feb 2022 at 11:05
Subject: Release of second instalment for research proposal

Dear Dr. Rajiv Kumar
This refers to your application regarding Research Proposal 40% Grant of Rs. 62,000/-
(Second Instalment) from the Research Promotion Fund 2018-19 & 2019-20 created out of the

Panjab University Alumni Association Fund.
Please find enclosed A cheque no. 715437 dated 07.02.2022 for Rs 62,000/- will be credited into your

account for as second instalment of total grant.
Mandatory guidelines for submitting completion report for the release of grant is as follows:

1. The completion report should be submitted within 6 month from the date of issue of 2nd

instalment to PI.

2. ltis mandatory to submit the detailed program report and research outcomes along with
consolidated item wise statement duly singed by the Pl and Principal/HOD. All
publications/conference presentations should duly acknowledge the contribution of PUAA.
3. Audit report from registered CA for PU Departments and College Auditors for affiliated

colleges.
4. Original bills with countersigned of Pl and Principal/HOD.

5. Photocopies of project stock register duly signed by Pl and Principal/HOD.
6. Letter/Certificate attested by the Principal/HOD for transfer of equipments/Assets purchased

from project grant to the particular College/Department Stock. Stating that from now onwards it is

the property of the College/Department.
7. Photocopy of Stock register of College/Department duly signed by the Principal/HOD showing
that the equipment/Assets (if any) was transferred to the College/Department.

8. If the utilization of total amount is not provided on time then appropriate action will

pursue. In case amount is not utilized till the time of submission of report, then money has to be
reimbursed to PUAA along with interest.

9. The unutilized grant (if any) may be returned immediately through RTGS/DD/Cheque/Cash to the
Dean Alumni Relations, Panjab University, Chandigarh in the name of PUAA and Alumni House Fund, Alc
no.: 10444985192, Branch: SBI, Sector-14, PU Campus, IFSC Code: SBIN0000742.



Note: | once again congratulate you and thank you for associating yourself with Department of Alumni

- Relations.
j / Thanks & regards,

Prof. Anupama Sharma
Dean, Alumni Relations
Panjab University
Chandigarh

Kuldeep Sandhu <kuldeepsinghsandhu.sandhu@gmail.com>
Draft To: "Dr. Rajiv Kumar" <rajiv_parashar17@yahoo.co.in>

Received, thank you.
[Quoted text hidden]

" kuldeep singh
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Goswami Ganesh Dutt Sanatan Dharam College, Hariana (Hsp.)
l

| Affiliated to Panjab University, Chandigarh
Formerly known As Hindu National College, HARIANA (Hoshiarpur) Delhi
| Run & Managed by Shri Sanatan Dharma Pratinidhi Sabha (Punjab) Paharganj, New Delhi.

Ref. No. \2.G 4. 34) 1| 793¢ Dated.. £ A 2=

--------------------------

Utilization Certificate

Certified that the grant of Rs. 1,55,000/- (Rupees One Lac Fifty Five Thousand

only) received from the Dean Alumni Relation, Panjab University, Chandigarh

under PU Alumni Association Research Promotion Grant for Research Project

entitled “Natural Gum Based Gel Biopolymer Electrolytes for Sustainable

Energy Sources” vide DARPU Letter received from Department of Alumni
Relations through Cheque Nos. 818760 dated 11/08/2020 Rs. 93,000/- & 715437
dated 07/02/2022 Rs. 62,000/~ has been fully utilized for the purpose for which it

was sanctioned and in accordance with the terms and conditions laid down by the

Panjab University.

Certified that the books and equipment relating to this project have been deposited

in the college and entered in the stock register.

G.G.D.S.D. Collgge
PRINCIPAL VESIGATOR _ HARIANA (HSp))

SIGNATURE|GF THE™ PRIN Ik{@l.

M €104 Qon s
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STATEMENT OF EXPENDITURE IN RESPECT OF RESEARCH PROJECT

i Name of the Principal Investigator: DR. RAJIV KUMAR

1.
2. College: G.G.D.S.D.College, Hariana, Hoshiarpur, Punjab
3. Scheme and Date: PU Alumni Association Research Promotion Grant, Dt. 21/07/2020

4. Title of the Research Project: Natural Gum Based Gel Biopolymer Electrolytes for

l:
{
.f
!
!
i

| Sustainable Energy Sources
5. Effective date of starting of the project: 21/07/2020
' 6. (a) Period of Expenditure: From 21-07-2020 to 25-08-2022

| (b) Details of Expenditure:

| S.No. [ Item Grant Grant Received | Total Expendit
Received - 1st | — 2" Instalment | Grant ure
Instalment (40%) (Rs.) in Received | Incurred
(60%) (Rs.) in | 2021-22 (Rs.)
2020-21 )

I Books & Journals 93,000/- 62,000/- [15,000/- [ 9,876/~ B
2. Equipment —| (Vide Cheque | (Vide Cheque [ 45,000/ | 35,900/- |
3. Field Work/Travel | No. 818760 dt. | No. 715437 dt. 15,000/- 22,780/-

(Give details in the 11/08/2020) 07/02/2022)
proforma at

| Annexure-VI J ‘ /

4, Chemicals & ] Fo,oow- [50,599/- ]

1 Glassware |
[s.__[Contingency | | [20,000/~ | 23257/~ |
6. Hiring Services | [ 10,000/- | 13,000/- |

[ Total | [ 93,000/- | 62,000/- [ 1,55,000/- ] 1,55,412/- |

It is certified that the grant of Rs. 1,55,000/- (Rupees One Lac Fifty Five Thousand only)

1.
“r;ecelved from the Panjab University Alumni Association Fund from the Research Promotion
ﬁund_for Research Project entitled “Natural Gum Based Gel Biopolymer Electrolytes fo
?ustamab]e Energy Sources” vide DARPU Letter received from Department of Al r
Relations on 21/07/2020 through Cheque Nos. 818760 dated 11/08/2020 Rs. 93,000/- & 71 um"m
gated 07/02/2022 Rs. 62,000/- has been fully utilized for the purpose for which i; w. '5437
and in accordance with the terms and conditions laid down by the Panjabas[s;?c“m.led
. Versity,

ghandigarh.
I
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